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1. Training courses and qualifications 

 
I am trying to find out what unofficial or official training courses and qualifications 
teachers (Headteachers, Management staff, support staff) in Midlothian and East 
Lothian schools have completed to be able to support young people with ASD, 
Mental Health and Autism. 

 
1. Within the teachers main training what training and qualifications are covered for 

ASD, Mental Health and Autism .  
 
2. Can you tell me if the training is a basic or advanced course and does it meet the 

criteria to be a formal qualification  
 

3. Can you please list these courses and qualifications in detail and if possible 
could you provide more information about these.  

 
4. Could you please tell me how teachers keep up to date with further training 

including CPD once they have qualified to be current standards In ASD, Mental 
Health and Autism training  

 
5. Can you please separate primary and secondary schools, headteacher, 

management staff, teachers and support staff 
 

6. In your professional option are teachers equipped to be able to identify young 
people and also be able to adapt their teaching to help support their continuous 
learning and why 

 
7. Do you think that specialist teachers need to play a part in GIRFEC. How many 

specialist teachers are there and what qualifications and training courses do they 
have to have achieved to help young people, can you list these training courses 
and qualifications please  

 
The local authorities said I have to contact GTCS for this information  

 
2.  Response  
 

I refer to your request for information dated 22 March 2022 which we have handled 
under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 (FOISA).  The information you 
requested was: 

 
1. Within the teachers main training what training and qualifications are covered for 

ASD, Mental Health and Autism.  
 



2. Can you tell me if the training is a basic or advanced course and does it meet the 
criteria to be a formal qualification  

 
3. Can you please list these courses and qualifications in detail and if possible could 

you provide more information about these.  
 

4. Could you please tell me how teachers keep up to date with further training 
including CPD once they have qualified to be current standards In ASD, Mental 
Health and Autism training  

 
5. Can you please separate primary and secondary schools, headteacher, 

management staff, teachers and support staff 
 

6. In your professional option are teachers equipped to be able to identify young 
people and also be able to adapt their teaching to help support their continuous 
learning and why 

 
7. Do you think that specialist teachers need to play a part in GIRFEC. How many 

specialist teachers are there and what qualifications and training courses do they 
have to have achieved to help young people, can you list these training courses 
and qualifications please 

 
GTC Scotland does not hold any information that can be provided in direct response to the 
questions you have posed, therefore I apply FOISA exemption S17 – information not held to 
the points above.   
 
In line with FOISA exemption S15 – Provide Advice and Guidance we thought that you may 
find the information provided below informative and helpful.  Where I have provided a link to 
the area of the website where you can find more details information, I apply FOISA 
exemption S25 – Information available elsewhere.  
 
The suite of Professional Standards for teachers set out what it means to become, be and 
grow as a teacher in Scotland. There are 2 mandatory, benchmark standards as we become 
and be teachers -  the Standard for Provisional Registration  and the Standard for Full 
registration; there are also 3 aspirational standards as we grow as teachers - the Standard 
for Career Long Professional Learning, the Standard for Middle Leadership and the 
Standard for Headship. 
 
The Professional Standard for Provisional Registration needs to be met by individuals on 
completion of their teaching qualification. Individuals with Provisional Registration then work 
towards meeting the Standard for Full Registration throughout their probationary period 
(completed either through the Teacher Induction Scheme or via the Flexible Route). 
Information on all of the Professional Standards can be found on our website here.  
  
You will find attached a document which provides information on GTC Scotland’s Initial 
Teacher Education (ITE) programmes Accreditation Criteria, you may find sections 3.3 and 
3.6 of the document particularly useful.   
 
All fully registered teachers are required to undertake professional learning as directed by 
their Professional Review and Development and every 5 years they maintain their 
registration with us though a Professional Update process. Information on the Professional 
Update process can be found on our website here.   
 
Though GTCS has a series of Professional Guides to support teachers professional 
learning, a teacher’s professional learning record and the types of professional learning 

https://www.gtcs.org.uk/professional-standards/professional-standards-for-teachers/
https://www.gtcs.org.uk/professional-update/


undertaken is directed and owned by each teacher and is discussed as part of the 
Professional Review and Development process.  
 
Further information on Professional Learning can be found on our website here.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.gtcs.org.uk/professional-update/professional-learning/
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